
Fresh Bread Products

RFP # 2008-028

Bid Request Number 2008-028

Title Fresh Bread Products

Close Date 4/17/2008

Line 1

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.20 Item 2700 28 grams 24

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.21 101-1033-0  Sunbeam King Thin. 

Bid Price per Loaf.

0.9 oz. 24 

Line 2

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.35 Item 2705 49 grams 14

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.38 101-4010-0  Sunbeam Texas 

Toast. Bid Price per Loaf.

1.4 oz. 15 

Line 3

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.45 Item 2656 26 grams 24

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.52 102-1530-0  Nature's Own 100% 

Whole Wheat. Bid Price per 

Loaf.

1.0 oz. 22

Line 4

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.24 134-1024-0  Nature's Own White 

Wheat  24 oz. Loaf. Bid Price per 

Loaf.

1.0 oz. 22 

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.44 Item 5487 28.5 grams 20

Line 5

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.54 Item 2015 32 grams 14

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $2.09 103-2030-0  Cobblestone Mill 

Sliced French Bread 16 oz. Bid 

Price per Loaf.

1.8 oz. 16 

Line 6

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.73 Item 1972 35 grams 13

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 7

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slices per 

loaf

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.54 103-2000-0  Cobblestone Mill 

Rye Bread. Bid Price per Loaf.

1.5 oz. 13 

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.67 Item 1971 35 grams 13

Line 8

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.76 Item 2850 52 grams 12

BREAD, WHITE.  1 1/2# Loaves White, Enriched, Sandwich Sliced Bread.

BREAD, WHITE.  1 1/2# Loaves Enriched, Thick Sliced "Texas Toast"  Bread.

BREAD, WHEAT.  1 1/2# Loaves Enriched, Sandwich Sliced  Bread

BREAD, WHOLE GRAIN WHITE.  1 1/4# Loaves Bread, Enriched, Sliced.

BREAD, FRENCH.  1 1/2# Loaves Bread, Enriched, Sliced.

BREAD, PUMPERNICKEL.  Sliced, Enriched Bread.

BREAD, RYE.  Dark or Light, Sliced.  Enriched.

BUN, HAMBURGER.  4" White Enriched, Bulk Pack.  Pre-sliced.
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Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $3.21 100-2670-0  Flowers 4" 

Hamburger Bun  30 count. Bid 

Price per Package.

1.9 oz. 30

Line 9

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.40 Item 5483

Item is 3 3/4"

43 grams 8

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.64 102-2582-0  Nature's Own 

Honey Wheat Hamburger Buns  

8 count. Bid Price per Package.

1.9 oz. 8

Line 10

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.18 Item 5486 74 grams 8

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $3.31 100-2566-0  Flowers 4.5" Wheat 

Hamburger Bun  20 count. Bid 

Price per Package.

2.7 oz. 20

Line 11

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.76 101-2733-2  Sunbeam 6" Hot 

Dog Bun  12 count. Bid Price per 

Package.

1.5 oz. 12

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.06 Item 1269 35 grams 16

Line 12

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.40 Item 5484 43 grams 8

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.54 103-2574-0  Cobblestone Mill 

Whole Grain Hot Dog Buns  8 

count. Bid Price per Package.

1.5 oz. 8

Line 13

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.30 Item 53102 76 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.38 103-2779-0  Cobblestone Mill 

Philly Hoagie  6 count. Bid Price 

per Package.

2.5 oz. 6

Line 14

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bun Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.07 Item 1053

Item is 4 1/2"

71 grams 12

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $3.28 100-2672-0  Flowers 4" Seeded 

Hamburger Bun  30 count. Bid 

Price per Package.

1.9 oz. 30

Line 15

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of roll Servings per 

package

BUN, HAMBURGER.  4" Wheat Enriched, Bulk Pack.  Pre-sliced.

BUN, HOT DOG.  White Enriched.  6 inch size. Pre-sliced.

BUN, HOT DOG.  Wheat Enriched.  6 inch size. Pre-sliced.

BUN, HOAGIE STEAK.  White Enriched. Pre-sliced, topped with sesame seeds.

BUN, HAMBURGER.  4.5" Wheat Enriched, Bulk Pack.  Pre-sliced.

BUN, BEEF.  4" White Enriched, topped with sesame seeds.

OVEN ROLLS.  Pre-sliced, White Enriched.
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Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $2.13 100-2912-0  Flowers White 

Dinner Rolls Sliced  12 count. 

Bid Price per Package.

1.0 oz. 6

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.15 Item 5507 40 grams 12

Line 16

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of roll Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 17

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of muffin Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.38 Item 40738 66 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.64 102-2797-0  Nature's Own 

English Muffins  6 count. Bid 

Price per Package.

2.0 oz. 6

Line 18

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of pita Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.85 Item 50413 33 grams per half 12 

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 19

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of pita Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.85 Item 50417 33 grams per half 12 

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 20

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of usable slice Usable slice per 

loaf

Earthgrains Baking Company $1.52 Item 53069 28 grams 20

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $1.52 102-1556-0  Nature's Own 

Honey Wheat. Bid Price per 

Loaf.

0.9 oz. 24 

Line 21

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bagel Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.29 Item 51253 104 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $2.29 102-9088-0  Nature's Own 

Honey Wheat Bagel. Bid Price 

per Package.

3.7 oz. 6

Line 22

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bagel Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.29 Item 51265 104 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $2.29 102-2800-0  Nature's Own Plain 

Bagel. Bid Price per Package.

3.7 oz. 6

Line 23

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bagel Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.29 Item 51266 104 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OVEN ROLLS.  Pre-sliced, Whole-Wheat Enriched.

ENGLISH MUFFINS.  Pre-sliced, White Enriched.

PLAIN PITA 

WHEAT PITA

HONEY WHEAT SLICED BREAD

WHEAT BAGEL

PLAIN BAGEL

BLUEBERRY BAGEL
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Line 24

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bagel Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.29 Item 51267 104 grams 6

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC $2.29 102-2804-0  Nature's Own 

Cinnamon Raisin Bagel. Bid 

Price per Package.

3.7 oz. 6

Line 25

Name Price Note to Buyer Weight of bagel Servings per 

package

Earthgrains Baking Company $2.29 Item 51255 37 grams 13

Flowers Baking Co. of Denton, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CINNAMON RAISIN BAGEL 

BREAKFAST BAGEL 
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