
Laminating Film and Laminators

Bid # 2008-021

Bid Request Number 2008-021 Comments:

Title Laminating Film and Laminators Recommended

Close Date 3/26/2008

Line 1

Name Price Note to Buyer

Competitive Edge $7.95 Dry-Lam Brand, part #SL1251-1 Withdrew this line item

Office Depot, Inc. $8.59 GBC Office Depot withdrew bid

Office Depot, Inc. $9.58/alt. HOP 12-500-1 @ $9.58 Office Depot withdrew bid

Scott Electric $10.04 Brand: Drylam  #: G1251-1 Brand Tested and approved Scott Electric

Laminator Warehouse $11.35 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

Asel Art Supply Inc. $11.55 HOP Industries Corp. LR-1.5x12/500

GBC - General Binding Corporation $13.99 GBC NapLam I P/N 3000002

School Specialty $15.75 669686 GBC 3000002 

Standard Stationery Supply Company $16.99 GBC 3000002

Brodart Co. $32.92 GBC - Brodart#84-473-301

Educator's Depot, Inc. no bid

Line 2

Name Price Note to Buyer

Office Depot, Inc. $11.59 GBC Office Depot withdrew bid

Standard Stationery Supply Company $13.39/alt. HOP 18-500-1 @ $13.39 Brand Tested-did not perform as well 

as Dry-Lam Brand

 

Competitive Edge $13.80 Dry-Lam Brand, part #G1851-1 Brand Tested and approved Competitive Edge 

Scott Electric $14.96 Brand: Drylam #: G1851-1

School Specialty $15.95 669689 GBC 3000003

Laminator Warehouse $15.99 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

Asel Art Supply Inc. $16.57 HOP Industries LR-1.5x18/500

GBC - General Binding Corporation $16.58 GBC NapLam I P/N 3000003

Standard Stationery Supply Company $20.64 GBC 3000003

Brodart Co. $39.60 GBC - Brodart#84-473-201

Educator's Depot, Inc. no bid

Line 3

Name Price Note to Buyer

Office Depot, Inc. $13.62 GBC Office Depot withdrew bid

Competitive Edge $15.95 Dry-Lam Brand, part #SL2551-1 Brand tested and approved Competitive Edge

Standard Stationery Supply Company $15.97/alt. HOP 25-500-1 @ $15.97

Laminator Warehouse $16.50 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

GBC - General Binding Corporation $17.29 GBC NapLam I P/N 3000004

Educator's Depot, Inc. $18.44 Bryce Doculam Film

Asel Art Supply Inc. $19.95 HOP Industries LR-1.5x25/500

Scott Electric $20.29 Brand: Drylam #: G2551-1

School Specialty $21.72 669692 GBC 3000004

Standard Stationery Supply Company $22.20 GBC #3000004

Brodart Co. $55.12 GBC -Brodart#84-473-101

GF Educators d/b/a The Learning Patch $60/alt. Two rolls per box.

Line 4

Name Price Note to Buyer

Competitive Edge $16.50 Dry-Lam Brand, part #SL2551-2 Brand tested and approved Competitive Edge

Laminator Warehouse $16.50 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

Scott Electric $21.05 Brand: Drylam #: G2551-2

GBC - General Binding Corporation $22.25 GBC NapLam I P/N 3000007

Standard Stationery Supply Company $27.26 GBC 3000007 - HOP: 25-500-2 $18.33

Educator's Depot, Inc. No Bid

School Specialty No Bid

Office Depot, Inc. No Bid

Asel Art Supply Inc. No Bid

Brodart Co. No Bid

Line 5

Name Price Note to Buyer

Laminating Film, 1.5 mil, 25" X 200', l" core

Laminating Film, 1.5 mil, 12" X 500', l" core

Laminating Film, 1.5 mil, 18" X 500', l" core

Laminating Film, 1.5 mil, 25" X 500', l" core

Laminating Film, 1.5 mil, 25" X 500', 2.25" core
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Laminating Film and Laminators

Bid # 2008-021

Title Laminating Film and Laminators Recommended

Standard Stationery Supply Company $7.28 Alt Brand Bid-Bryce Doculam Film Past experince with this brand has not 

been satisfactory

Asel Art Supply Inc. $11.32 HOP Inustries LR1.5x25"x200 Brand tested and was ok, but not as 

good as GBC or DryLam

School Specialty $11.39 616488 GBC 3133113 GBC is a proven brand of film School Specialty

GBC - General Binding Corporation $15.96 GBC NapLam I P/N 3133113

Laminator Warehouse $27.50 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

Competitive Edge $28.50 Dry-Lam Brand, part #G2520-1

Educator's Depot, Inc. $0.00 Bryce Doculam Film

Office Depot, Inc. No Bid

Brodart Co. No Bid

Line 6

Name Price Note to Buyer

GBC - General Binding Corporation $36.10 1.2 Mil 27" x 720' GBC NapLam I 

P/N 3021998

Proven history of use with this 

vendor

GBC (General 

Binding 

Corportation)

Laminator Warehouse $55.75 Brand being bid is Transilwrap.

Brodart Co. $62.55/alt. GBC Brodart#84-473-401* 

*Bidding Alternate 27" x 500'

School Specialty No Bid

Office Depot, Inc. No Bid

Asel Art Supply Inc. No Bid

Competitive Edge No Bid

Educator's Depot, Inc. $0.00

Standard Stationery Supply Company No Bid

Line 7

Name Percent Off Note to Buyer

Educator's Depot, Inc. 0% Educator's Depot, 

Inc.Standard Stationery Supply Company No Bid

Laminator Warehouse No Bid

Brodart Co. 15% **Please see attached Brodart Terms and 

Conditions**

Brodart Co.

Competitive Edge 15% Competitive Edge

Asel Art Supply Inc. 20%  From Asel catalog Asel Art Supply Inc.

GBC - General Binding Corporation 30% Excludes custom, sourced equipment, 

wide format laminators, shredders and 

parts/service.

GBC - General 

Binding 

Corporation

Office Depot, Inc. 85% a range of 5%-85% off list Office Depot, Inc.

Line 8

Name Price Note to Buyer

Brodart Co. $62.55 GBC -Brodart#84-385-001

*Please see Catalog Page 472 for Specs*

Wrong pricing

Asel Art Supply Inc. $1,092.50 HOP Industries TCC-2700 includes a 1yr. 

warranty

No references, no prior experience, 

new product

Standard Stationery Supply Company $1,191.83 No brand listed

Office Depot, Inc. $1,249.99 GBC Ultima 65 1 yr. warr., not extendable

GBC - General Binding Corporation $1,299.00 GBC Ultima 65 P/N 1710740 Includes an extendable onsite 

warranty

GBC (General 

Binding Corp)

School Specialty $1,459.99 068019 GBC ULTIMA 65 1710740

Educator's Depot, Inc. $1,623.75 GBC ULTA 65

Laminator Warehouse $1,989.00 Brand being bid is GBC Ultima 65.  On-

site service available.

Competitive Edge No Bid

1.5 mil, 27"X 750', 1" core (must fit a GBC Ultima 65 with a lower heat 

activation)

State discount off list for any other item not included in the line items 

above.

Laminator - heated nip rollers, 27" film width, wrap-free tunnel design, 

infrared heating, motor driven heat rollers, soft, silicone heat rollers, 

preset operating positions, be able to use Ultima 1.9 Mil Film.(GBC 

Ultima 65 or equal).
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