
Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Bid Request Number 2007-058

Title

Close Date 9/5/2007

Line 1

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 2

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$195.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 3

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $175.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $210.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$215.00 Price is Based on $0.215 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $331.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 4

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $175.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $225.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$260.00 Price is based on $0.26 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $432.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price  

(500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(1,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(1,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal

1



Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Line 5

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $250.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$322.50 Price is based on $0.215 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $449.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 6

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $275.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$390.00 Price is bassed on $0.26 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $600.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 7

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $320.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $340.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$410.00 Price is based on $0.205 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $567.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 8

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $340.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $355.00 If additonal hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$500.00 Price is based on $0.25 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $769.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 9

Name Price Note to Buyer

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(1,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(1,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(2,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(2,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(2,500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $385.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $425.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$512.50 Price is based on $0.205 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $780.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 10

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $405.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $425.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$625.00 Price is based on $0.25 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $1,033.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 11

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $445.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $500.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$615.00 Price is based on $0.205 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $993.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 12

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $485.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $500.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$750.00 Price is based on $0.25 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $1,269.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 13

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $505.00 If addtional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(2,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(3,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(3,000 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD - Semi-Annual Bid Price 

(3,500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Earth America $580.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$717.50 Price is based on $0.205 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $1,111.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 14

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $545.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $580.00 Primary
Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$875.00 Price is based on $0.25 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $1,465.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 15

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary
Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft. is 

needed an extra charge will apply
Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 16

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary
Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 

needed an extra charge will apply
Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 17

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Kitchen Grease Traps - Plano ISD Call-in Basis Bid Price 

(3,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #1 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #1 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #7 (500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 18

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 19

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 20

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 21

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Priced is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 22

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #7 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #8 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #8 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #9 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #9 (500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 23

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 24

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $ 0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 25

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Price is based on $0.24 per gallon

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $175.00 Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 26

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $175.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #10 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #10 (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Fire Station #11  (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Fire Station #11 (500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 27

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$120.00 Priced is based on $0.24 per gallon

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $145.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $213.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 28

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $135.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $185.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$190.00 Price is based on $0.39 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $264.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 29

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $210.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$215.00 Price is based on $0.215 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $331.00

Earth America $340.00 Primary

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 30

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $225.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$260.00 Price is based on $0.26 per gallon

Earth America $340.00 Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $432.00

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-Municipal Center (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Municipal Center (500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - 

Semi-Annual Bid Price-Pecan Hollow Golf Pro Shop (1,000 

gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Pecan Hollow Golf Pro Shop (1,000 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 31

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $250.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$322.50 Price is based on $0.215 per gallon 

PSC Recovery Systems $449.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 32

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $275.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$390.00 Price is based on $0.26 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $600.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 33

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $250.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$322.50 Price is based on $0.215 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $449.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Line 34

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $250.00 Primary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $275.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$390.00 Price is based on $0.26 per gallon

PSC Recovery Systems $600.00

Cactus Environmental Services No Bid

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Plano Centre (1,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - 

Semi-Annual Bid Price-Senior Center (1,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano Call-in Basis Bid Price-

Senior Center (1,500 gallons)

Kitchen Grease Traps - City of Plano - Semi-Annual Bid 

Price-PlanoCentre (1,500 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Line 35

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $350.00

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $375.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$450.00 Price is based on $0.45 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $500.00

Cactus Environmental Services $720.00

Line 36

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $350.00

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $390.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$500.00 Price is based on $0.50 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $600.00

Cactus Environmental Services $1,295.00

Line 37

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $350.00

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $375.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$450.00 Price is based on $0.45 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $500.00

Cactus Environmental Services $720.00

Line 38

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $350.00

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $390.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$500.00 Priced is based on $0.50 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $600.00

Cactus Environmental Services $1,295.00

Line 39

Name Price Note to Buyer

Sand Traps - Transportation - Annual Bid Price                 

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - Transportation - Call-in Basis Bid Price    

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - Bus Wash - Annual Bid Price                        

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - Bus Wash - Call-in Basis Bid Price                

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - PSHS AG Barn-1 - Annual Bid Price              

(250 gallons)
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$150.00 Price is based on $0.60 per gallon Secondary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $196.00

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $495.00

Line 40

Name Price Note to Buyer
Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 

needed an extra charge will apply
Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$212.50 Price is based on $0.85 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $222.00

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $1,075.00

Line 41

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$150.00 Price is based on $0.60 per gallon Secondary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $196.00

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $495.00

Line 42

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$212.50 Price is based on $0.85 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $222.00

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $1,075.00

Line 43

Name Price Note to Buyer

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$150.00 Price is based on $0.60 per gallon Secondary

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $196.00

Sand Traps - PSHS AG Barn-2 - Annual Bid Price          

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - PSHS AG Barn-2 - Call-in Basis Bid Price             

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - High Point AG Barn - Annual Bid Price          

(1,000 gallons)

Sand Traps - PSHS AG Barn-1 - Call-in Basis Bid Price         

(1,000 gallons) 
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Kitchen Grease, Sand and Acid Trap Removal
Bid # 2007-058

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $495.00

Line 44

Name Price Note to Buyer

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $175.00 If additional hose over 100 ft is 
needed an extra charge will apply

Primary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$212.50 Price is based on $0.85 per gallon Secondary

PSC Recovery Systems $222.00

Earth America $275.00

Cactus Environmental Services $1,075.00

Line 45

Name Price Note to Buyer

Cactus Environmental Services $350.00 Secondary

Earth America $500.00 Primary

PSC Recovery Systems $0.00 no bid

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$0.00 LES does not provide this service

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $0.00 N/A for acid traps

Line 46

Name Price Note to Buyer

Earth America $500.00 Primary

Cactus Environmental Services $1,775.00 Secondary

Liquid Environmental Solutions of 
Texas, LP

$0.00 LES does not provide this service

Dal-Worth Industries, Inc. $0.00 N/A for acid traps

PSC Recovery Systems $0.00 no bid

Acid Traps - Overall pricing for: Vacuum Truck and 

Operator, Trap Cleanout, Fluid Disposal and Change Out of 

Limestone

Acid Traps - Price Per Confined Space Entry

Sand Traps - High Piont AG Barn - Call-In Basis Bid Price           

(1,000 gallons)
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