
Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Baker

Distribution

Company

Barsco Coolgas, Ltd. Hudson

Technology

Refron, Inc.

1 Freon® or equal, R-22, 125 lb. Drums 

Chemical name-Chlorodifluromethane

**Brands that we 

supply are: 

Arkema-"Forane", 

DuPont-"Freon", 

"Suva", Honeywell-

"Genetron", Ineos-

"Klea" & Refron- 

"Refron".

A. Price per pound: $3.20 $3.40 $2.59 $2.68 $2.858

B. Price per drum: $400.00 $425.00 $323.75 $335.00 $357.25

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin virgin virgin

D. Brand name- Dupont Honeywell Solvay Glacier ** see above

E. Cylinder Deposit (per cylinder) no bid $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 1:

1 day 1 day 2 days same day to

1 day

1-2 days

ARO

2 Freon®, R-11, 100 lb. Drums

Chemical Name-Trichlorofluoromethane

A. Price per pound: $8.55 $6.50 $4.40 $5.25 $5.95

B. Price per drum: $855.00 $650.00 $440.00 $525.00 $595.00

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed

D. Brand name - Dupont CFC Refro-

Max

no bid Hudson ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 2:

2 days 2 days 2 days same day to

1 day

1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

3 Freon®, R-502, 30 lb. Drums

Chemical Name: 

Chlorodifluoromethane/

Chloropentafluorothane

A. Price per pound: $21.60 $18.00 $16.50 $13.00 $13.50

B. Price per drum: $648.00 $540.00 $495.00 $390.00 $405.00

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed

D. Brand name - Dupont CFC Refro-

Max

no bid Hudson ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 3:

2 days no bid 2 days same day to

1 day

1-2days

4 Freon®, 404A, 24 lb. Drums

Chemical Name: Pentafluoroethane/1, 

1,

1-Trifluoroethane/1, 1, 1, 

2-Tetrafluoroethane

A. Price per pound: $8.56 $9.375 $7.83 no bid $7.80

B. Price per drum: $205.44 $225.00 $188.00 no bid $187.20

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin virgin virgin

D. Brand name - Dupont Honeywell Honeywell Dupont ** see above

Vendors:
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Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Baker

Distribution

Company

Barsco Coolgas, Ltd. Hudson

Technology

Refron, Inc.Vendors:

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 4:

2 days 1 day 2 days same day to

1 day

1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

5 Freon®, R-12, 30 lb. Drums

Chemical Name- 

Dichlorodifluoromethane

A. Price per pound: $24.35 $20.00 $20.83 $16.45 $15.833

B. Price per drum: $729.00 $600.00 $625.00 $493.50 $474.99

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed reclaimed

D. Brand name - Dupont CFC Refro-

Max

no bid Hudson ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 5:

2 days 2 days 2 days no bid 1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

6 Freon®, 134A, 30 lb. Drums

Chemical Name: 1, 1, 1, 2-

Tetrafluoroethane

A. Price per pound: $5.85 $7.40 $2.93 $3.10 $6.22

B. Price per drum: $175.50 $222.00 $88.00 $93.00 $186.60

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin virgin virgin

D. Brand name - Dupont Honeywell Sinochem Ineos ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 6:

no bid 1 day no bid no bid 1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

7 Freon®, R-22, 30 lb. Drums

Chemical Name-Chlorodifluoromethane

A. Price per pound: $3.10 $3.533 $2.60 $2.81 $2.87

B. Price per drum: $93.00 $106.00 $78.00 $84.30 $86.10

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin virgin virgin

D. Brand name - Dupont Honeywell Solvay Glacier ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 7:

2 days 1 day no bid no bid 1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

8 Freon®, R-123, 100 lb. Drums

Chemical Name-1,1-Dichloro-2,2,

2-Trifluoroethane

A. Price per pound: $5.92 $5.00 $3.69 $4.10 $4.15

B. Price per drum: $592.00 $500.00 $369.00 $410.00 $415.00

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin Dupont-

Virgin

virgin

D. Brand name - Dupont Honeywell Sinochem Dupont ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 8:

no bid 10 days 2 days no bid 1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)
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Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Baker

Distribution

Company

Barsco Coolgas, Ltd. Hudson

Technology

Refron, Inc.Vendors:

9 Freon® or equal, R-407C, 25 lb. Drums

Chemical Name-1,1,1,2-

Tetrafluoroethane

Pentafluoroethane

Difluoroethane

A. Price per pound: $11.99 $10.00 $8.40 $10.36 $10.142

B. Price per drum: $299.75 $250.00 $210.00 $259.00 $253.55

C. Virgin or reclaimed? virgin virgin virgin virgin virgin

D. Brand name - Dupont Honeywell Honeywell Dupont ** see above

F. Please indicate the number of days for 

    delivery ARO for Item 8:

2 days 10 days no bid no bid 1-2 days

ARO 

(emergencies 

sooner)

State discount from list price for 

all items sold by your company not listed in 

this bid.  A copy of the price list must be 

available upon request.

60%-70% 50% approx. no bid n/a discount varies 

depending on the 

refrigerant type, 

size, qty., & date 

of purchase.

State discount off price list of all 

items sold by your company not included in 

this bid if purchases are made at your place 

of business using a purchasing card.

60%-70% 50% approx. no bid n/a discount varies 

depending on the 

refrigerant type, 

size, qty., & date 

of purchase.

** Note-Bid is 

being offered on 

an "all or none 

basis" for all 

items awarded.
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Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Recommended

Coolgas, Ltd.

Coolgas, Ltd.

Hudson

Technology

Coolgas, Ltd.
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Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Recommended

Hudson

Technology

Coolgas, Ltd.

Coolgas, Ltd.

Coolgas, Ltd.
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Refrigerants

Bid 3774

Recommended

Coolgas, Ltd.
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