
Formal Wear

Bid # 2007-020

2007-020

Formal Wear

ITB

3/29/2007

Line Description Al's Formal 

Wear

Althuser, Inc Dance 

Sophisticates

DeMoulin 

Brothers & Co.

K. Barbosa 

Promotions, 

Inc.

Recommended

1 DRESS:

Style #12097C

no bid $59.00 $58.00 $69.95 no bid Dance Sophisticates

2 MEN'S TUXEDO:

Black 100% polyester 

tuxedo jacket

Fully lined

Satin peak lapels

Two front flap pockets

Back center vent

$39.95 no bid no bid $50.95 $100.00 Al's Formal Wear

3 MEN'S TUXEDO:

Black 100% polyester 

tuxedo pants

Pleated front

Adjustable waist

Satin leg stripe

$19.95 no bid no bid $25.95 $30.00 Al's Formal Wear

4 MEN'S TUXEDO:

Black Poly-satin 

adjustable bow 

tie/cummerbund

$5.95 no bid no bid $11.75 $14.00 Al's Formal Wear

5 TUXEDO ENSEMBLES:

Tuxedo ensembles 

(peaked-lapel jacket, 

adjustable waist pants, 

cummerbund, and bow 

tie) see Lines #2, #3, 

#4 above

$68.95 no bid no bid $88.65 $128.00 Al's Formal Wear
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