Bleacher Maintenance
Bid # 2007-025

Bid Request Number 2007-025
Title Bleacher Maintenance
Close Date 5/14/2007
Recommended

Line 1 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Plano East Senior High School
Name no bids received No Bid
Line 2 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Plano Senior High School
Name no bids received No Bid
Line 3 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Plano West Senior High School
Name no bids received No Bid
Line 4 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Clark High School
Name no bids received No Bid
Line 5 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Jasper High School
Name no bids received No Bid
Line 6 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Shepton High School
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $14,920.00 John F. Clark
Line 7 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Vines High School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 8 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Williams High School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 9 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Armstrong Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 10 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Bowman Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 11 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Carpenter Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
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Line 12 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Frankford Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 13 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Haggard Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 14 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Hendrick Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 15 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Murphy Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 16 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Renner Middle School
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $580.00 John F. Clark
Line 17 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Rice Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 18 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Robinson Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 19 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Schimelpfenig Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 20 Pre-Bid Repair Costs at Wilson Middle School
Name Price

no bids received No Bid
Line 21 Plano East Senior High School Annual Bleacher
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $1,080.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $9,500.00

Line 22

Plano Senior High School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name

|Price
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John F. Clark Company $1,040.00 John F. Clark

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $9,500.00

Line 23 Plano West Senior High School Annual Bleacher

Inspection

Name Price Item Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $4,800.00

John F. Clark Company No Bid

Line 24 Clark High School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price Item Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $3,000.00

John F. Clark Company No Bid

Line 25 Jasper High School An

nual Bleacher Inspection

Name

Price

Iltem Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC

$3,840.00

John F. Clark Company

No Bid

Line 26 Shepton High School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $620.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $2,200.00

Line 27 Vines High School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price Item Not

Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC

$2,400.00

John F. Clark Company

No Bid

Line 28 Williams High School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price Item Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $2,640.00

John F. Clark Company No Bid

Line 29

Armstrong Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection
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Name Price Iltem Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $2,400.00

John F. Clark Company No Bid

Line 30 Bowman Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $430.00 John F. Clark

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,200.00

Line 31 Carpenter Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $430.00 John F. Clark

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,400.00

Line 32 Frankford Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $480.00 John F. Clark

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,400.00

Line 33 Haggard Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price Item Not
Recommended for
Award

Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,440.00

John F. Clark Company No Bid

Line 34 Hendrick Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $430.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,800.00

Line 35 Renner Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $580.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,400.00

Line 36 Rice Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name Price

John F. Clark Company $480.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,400.00

Line 37

Robinson Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection

Name

|Price
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John F. Clark Company $480.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,800.00
Line 38 Schimelpfenig Middle School Annual Bleacher
Inspection
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $480.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $1,400.00
Line 39 Wilson Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection
Name Price Item Not
Recommended for
Award
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $2,400.00
John F. Clark Company No Bid
Line 40 State percentage mark-up on manufacturer's
published price list for repair parts.
Name Percentage
John F. Clark Company 17.00% John F. Clark
Line 41 State hourly rate per person for bleacher
repairs at District locations.
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $65.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $79.00
Line 42 State hourly rate for emergency repairs.
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $85.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $118.50
Line 43 Murphy Middle School Annual Bleacher Inspection
Name Price
John F. Clark Company $480.00 John F. Clark
Specialty Supply and Installation LLC $2,000.00




