Custom Printing - Communications
Bid # 2008-034

Bid Request Number
Title

Close Date
Line 1

Name

Advantage Resources Services

Advantage Resources Services

Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Endless Business Solutions,
Inc.

JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.

Slocum Printing

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Thompson's Quick Print
Dallas Offset, Inc.

Line 2

Name

Endless Business Solutions,
Inc.

JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.

Slocum Printing

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Advantage Resources Services
Thompson's Quick Print
Dallas Offset, Inc.

Line 3

Name

Dallas Offset, Inc.

Advantage Resources Services
Advantage Resources Services
JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.
Slocum Printing

Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Thompson's Quick Print

Line 4
Name

Dallas Offset, Inc.

Advantage Resources Services
JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.

Slocum Printing

Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Thompson's Quick Print

2008-034
Custom Printing - Communications
4/17/2008

Four-Part Relocation Packet System: Vertical Pocket Folder; Large Mailing Envelope; 50,000
Calendar Books; Employee Inservice Brochure

Price
$11,565.61/alt.

Note to Buyer

Vendor bid on Vertical Pocket Folder only with alt. 100# Accent
Opaque Cover

$15,626.80 Vendor bid on Vertical Pocket Folder only.
$21,585.78 This price includes Pocket Folders, Envelope and Employee
Inservice Brochure only. Does not include Calendar Book.
$62,733/alt. Alternate: 80# Accent Opaque Smooth White Cover; 80#
Accent Opaque Smooth White Text
$81,922.18
$97,643.00

$103,529.00

No Bid
No Bid

Four-Part Relocation Packet System: Vertical Pocket Folder; Large Mailing Envelope; 55,000
Calendar Books; Employee Inservice Brochure

Price Note to Buyer
$66,237/alt. Alternate: 80# Accent Opaque Smooth White Cover; 80#
Accent Opaque Smooth White Text
$88,463.79

$104,343.00
$108,641.00

$123,481.83
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Two-Part Student/Parent Policy Guide System (60,000 English and 5,000 Spanish)
Note to Buyer
Alternate Paper: 70# White Opaque

Price
$27,964/alt.
$45,658.24/alt.
$68,283.77
$76,116.35
$91,865.00
$120,378.46
No Bid

Alternate Paper: 100# Accent Opaque Cover

No Bid

Two-Part Student/Parent Policy Guide System (65,000 English and 5,000 Spanish)

Price
$29,693/alt.

Note to Buyer
Alternate Paper: 70# White Opaque

$60,351.17 Vendor bid price for English only

$81,119.27
$98,665.00

$129,471.96
No Bid

No Bid

Recommended

Endless Business
Solutions, Inc.

Endless Business
Solutions, Inc.

No award

Dallas Offset, Inc.




Custom Printing - Communications
Bid # 2008-034

Line 5
Name

Thompson's Quick Print

Endless Business Solutions,
Inc.

JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Slocum Printing
Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Advantage Resources Services
Dallas Offset, Inc.

Line 6
Name

Thompson's Quick Print

Advantage Resources Services

Advantage Resources Services
Slocum Printing

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

Munoz Printing Co. Inc.

Endless Business Solutions, Inc.

JMB Business Forms 2000, Inc.
Dallas Offset, Inc.

District Digest Shells
Price

$7,340.55/alt.
$10,800/alt.

$16,047.50/alt.

$16,800/alt.
$19,391.00

$19,795.86/alt.

No Bid
No Bid

School Board Brochure

Price

$1,240.00/alt.

$2,219.70/alt.

$2,753.51
$3,961.00
$4,500/alt.

$4,616.63

$5,362.00

$6,027.78
No Bid

Note to Buyer

Alternate 70# Finch Opaque Smooth Bright White is too
transparent

Alternate: 70# Accent Opaque Smooth White Text Endless Business
Solutions, Inc.

Alternate Paper - 70# Carnival Smooth Softwhite Text

Alternate: 70# Carnival Soft White Text

Alternate: 70# Genesis Snow Day text.

Note to Buyer

Alternate: 100# Accent Opaque Cover Thompson's Quick Print

Alternate: 80+# Accent Opaque Cover; 100# Accent Opaque Text

Alt.: 80# Accent Opaque Smooth White Cover and 80# Accent
Opaque Smooth White Text.




