Glass Installation and Materials
Bid # 2007-041

Bid Request #
Title
Close Date

Line 1

Name

Binswanger Glass

2007-048
Glass-Installation and Material
7/12/2007

1/8" Clear Tempered Glass

Price Note to Buyer

$2.90 min 3 square feet per unit.

Recommended

Binswanger Glass

Line 2

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/8" Tinted Tempered Glass (Bronze or Gray)

Price Note to Buyer
$3.20 min. 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 3

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Clear Tempered Glass

Price Note to Buyer

$3.75 min. 3 square feet per unit,
seamed edges.

Binswanger Glass

Line 4

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Tinted Tempered Glass (Bronze or Gray)

Price Note to Buyer

$3.95 min. 3 square feet per unit,
seamed edges.

Binswanger Glass

Line 5

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Wire Glass

Price Note to Buyer

$11.10 min 3 square feet per unit,
seamed edges

Binswanger Glass

Line 6

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/8" Clear Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$1.75 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 7

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/8" Tinted Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$1.95 min. 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 8

Name
Binswanger Glass

3/16" Clear Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$2.50 min. 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass




Glass Installation and Materials
Bid # 2007-041

Line 9

Name
Binswanger Glass

3/16" Tinted Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$2.90 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 10

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Clear Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$2.75 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 11

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Tinted Single Pane Glass

Price Note to Buyer
$2.95 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 12

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Clear Lexan

Price
$8.90

Binswanger Glass

Line 13

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Tinted Lexan

Price
$9.75

Binswanger Glass

Line 14

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Clear Plexiglas

Price
$3.75

Binswanger Glass

Line 15

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Tinted Plexiglas

Price
$4.25

Binswanger Glass

Line 16

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Clear Laminated

Price Note to Buyer
$7.95 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 17

Name
Binswanger Glass

1/4" Tinted Laminated

Price Note to Buyer
$8.95 min 3 square feet per unit

Binswanger Glass

Line 18

Name
Binswanger Glass

1" Clear Insulated Annealed (Plate)

Price
$5.20

Binswanger Glass




Glass Installation and Materials
Bid # 2007-041

Line 19

Name
Binswanger Glass

1" Tinted Insulated Annealed (Plate) Binswanger Glass

Price
$5.95

Line 20

Name
Binswanger Glass

1" Clear Insulated Tempered Binswanger Glass

Price
$8.45

Line 21 1" Tinted Insulated Tempered Binswanger Glass
Name Price

Binswanger Glass $8.99

Line 22 Mirror Glass Binswanger Glass
Name Price

Binswanger Glass $3.25

Line 23 Table-Top Smked Glass No bid
Name Price

Binswanger Glass No Bid

Line 24

Name
Binswanger Glass

Window Tinting Film Binswanger Glass

Price
$4.00

Line 25

Name
Binswanger Glass

Service Call Charge, if Applicable Binswanger Glass

Price Is there a service call charge?
$39.00 Yes

Line 26

Name

Binswanger Glass

One Man Hourly Rate for Glass Installation Binswanger Glass

Price Is there a minimum # of hours ' What is the minimum # of
for a one-man glass crew? hours for a one-man glass
crew?
$39.00 yes 2

Line 27

Name

Binswanger Glass

One Man Overtime Hourly Rate for Glass Installation Binswanger Glass

Price Is there a minimum # of What is the minimum # of
overtime hours for a one-man ' overtime hours for a one-man
glass crew? glass crew?
$58.00 yes 2




Glass Installation and Materials

Bid # 2007-041

Line 28

Name

Binswanger Glass

Two Man Hourly Rate for Glass Installation

Price

$78.00

Binswanger Glass

What is the minimum # of
hours for a two-man glass
crew?

yes 2

Is there a minimum # of hours
for a two-man glass crew?

Line 29 Two Man Overtime Hourly Rate for Glass Installation Binswanger Glass
Name Price Is there a minimum # of What is the minimum # of
overtime hours for a two-man | overtime hours for a two-man
glass crew? glass crew?
Binswanger Glass $116.00 yes 2
Line 30 One Man Hourly Rate for Glass Tinting no bid
Name Price Is there a minimum # of hours = What is the minimum # of
for a one-man glass tinting hours for a one-man glass
crew? tinting crew?
Binswanger Glass No Bid yes no bid
Line 31 Two Man Hourly Rate for Glass Tinting no bid
Name Price Is there a minimum # of hours .~ What is the minimum # of
for a two-man glass tinting hours for a two-man glass
crew? tinting crew?
Binswanger Glass No Bid yes no bid

Line 32

Name
Binswanger Glass

Hourly Rate for Store Front Repair and Installations

Price
$39.00

Binswanger Glass

Note to Buyer

vistawall, ykk, us aluminum,
kawneer

Line 33

Name
Binswanger Glass

State discount off price list or catalog of all items sold

Binswanger Glass

by your company not included in this bid.

Percent Off
50%

NO BIDS:

Altair Company




