
Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

Recommendations

Section I - Line Items for 

Kitchen Repair Parts

1 Accutemp

Discount No Bid 31% 41.2% No Bid 37.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

accutemp.

net

No Bid

2 Acme

Discount No Bid 0% No Bid No Bid 5.5% 10% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Alto-Sham

Discount No Bid 31% 41.8% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.alto-

sham.com

No Bid

4 American Panel

Discount No Bid No Bid Net X's 130% No Bid 0% No Bid All vendors that 

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 American Permanent Ware

Discount No Bid 31% 36.4% No Bid 31.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

apwwyott.

com
6 Amco

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Anets

Discount No Bid 31% 36.3% No Bid 31.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

anets

berger.com

www.

anets

berger.com

8 Arctic Temp

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Argos

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Asco

Discount No Bid No Bid 10.5% No Bid 11% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 Bally

Discount No Bid No Bid 32.3% No Bid 35.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.bally

refboxes.

com

www.bally

refboxes.

 com

12 Berkel

Discount No Bid 20% 41.2% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

berkel.com

www.

berkel.com

13 Beverage Air

Vendors:
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Discount No Bid 30% 36.3% 23.00% 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid www.

beverage-

air.com

www.

beverage-

air.com

www.

beverage-

air.com
14 Blakeslee

Discount No Bid 20% 29.4% No Bid 18.5%-30.5%

18.5%

accessories

35% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

blakesleeinc.

com

No Bid

15 Blodgett

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 32% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

blodgett.com

No Bid

16 Bloomfield

Discount No Bid 31% 41.6% No Bid 37.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

wellsbloom

field.com

www.

wellsbloom

field.com
17 Bohn

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

heatcraftr

pd

.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 Bunn-O-Matic

Discount No Bid 31% 42.2% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

bunnomatic.

com

www.

bunnomatic.

com
19 Cambro

Discount No Bid 31% 30.5% No Bid No Bid 35% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Can Pro

Discount No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 Carter-Huffman

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.gscparts

.

com

No Bid No Bid www.carter-

huffman.

com

No Bid

22 Case

Discount No Bid 0% 30.5% No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Champion

Discount No Bid 31% 42.3% No Bid 41% 41% All vendors that

submitted

2



Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

champion

industries.

com

www.

champion

industries.

com

24 Chandler

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

heatcraft

rpd.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Chicago Faucet

Discount No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 Cleveland

Discount No Bid 31% 42.4% No Bid 18.5%-40.5%

18.5%-boilers

20.0%-combi

41%,

25%-boilers

All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.cleveland

range.com

No Bid

27 Climate Control

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

heatcraft

rpd.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Conbraco

Discount No Bid No Bid 10.5% No Bid 30.75% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Continental

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.5% 15% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

continental-

refrig.com

No Bid

30 Copeland

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

emerson

climate

contractor

.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 Cornelius

Discount No Bid No Bid 41.2% No Bid 41.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.cornelius

.

www.cornelius.

com

32 Cres-Cor

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.crescor.

com

www.crescor.

com

33 Crystal Tips

Discount No Bid 20% 30.5% No Bid 25.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

iceomatic.com

34 Cuisinart

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 Dean Industries

Discount No Bid 31% 41.7% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

dean.enodis.

com

www.

frymaster.

com
36 Delfield

Discount No Bid 31% 41.4% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

delfield.com

www.

delfield.com
37 Ditto Dean

Discount No Bid 30% 30.5% No Bid 36.5% 50% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

electrolux

usa.com

No Bid

38 Dixie Narco

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 Dormont

Discount No Bid 30% 42.1% No Bid 51% 55% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

dormont.com

No Bid

40 Duke Mfg. (Thermaduke)

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 42.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

dukemfg.com

No Bid

41 Dutchess

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 Edlund

Discount No Bid 20% 41.7% No Bid 37.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

edlundco.com

www.

edlundco.com

43 Epco

Discount No Bid 31% 40.5% No Bid 36.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

useco.com

No Bid

44 Erika

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 Everpure

Discount No Bid 31% 50.2% 48% 50% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid www.

everpure.com

www.

everpure.com

No Bid

46 Farberware

Discount No Bid No Bid 10.5% No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Fasco

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 Fisher

Discount No Bid 31% 41.4% No Bid 35.75% 41% All vendors that

submitted

4



Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI
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L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

fisher-mfg.

com

No Bid

49 Follett

Discount No Bid 31% 5.5% No Bid 7.5% 15% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 Franklin

Discount No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid 42.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 Frymaster

Discount No Bid 31% 42.1% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

frymaster.

com

www.

frymaster.

com
52 Garland/US Range

Discount No Bid 31% 41.8% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

garland.

group.com

www.

garland.

group.com
53 Gemini

Discount No Bid 0% 7.3% No Bid 8.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gscparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 General Electric

Discount varies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55 Grainger

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

56 Groen

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 10.5%-30.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

unified 

brands.net

www.

groen.com

57 Hamilton Beach

Discount No Bid 20% 40.4% No Bid 36.5% 20% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

hamilton

beach.com

No Bid

58 Hatco

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.hatco

corp.com

www.hatco

corp.com

59 Hobart

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 Honeywell

Discount varies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website www.

honeywell

.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

61 Hoshizaki

Discount No Bid 0% 21.2% No Bid 22.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial
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L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

hoshizaki.

com

No Bid

62 Ice-O-Matic

Discount No Bid 0% 30.5% No Bid 28.75% 30% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

iceomatic.

com

No Bid

63 Innova

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64 In-Sink-erator

Discount No Bid 20% 40.5% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

insinkerator.

com

No Bid

65 Intek

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 Jennaire

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

67 Johnstone Supply

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

68 Kason 

Discount No Bid 31% 20.5% No Bid 30.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

69 Keating

Discount No Bid 0% 15.5% No Bid 22.5% 10% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

keating

ofchicago.

com

No Bid

70 Keene

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

71 Kelvinator

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 Kenmore

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 KitchenAid

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

74 Kolddraft

Discount No Bid 0% 30.5% No Bid 25.75% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 Lakeside

Discount No Bid 31% 32.5% No Bid 30.75% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

elakeside.

com

www.

elakeside.

com6
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Barsco Ecolab
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Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

76 Lang

Discount No Bid 31% 41.5% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

langworld.

com

www.

langworld.

com
77 Larkin

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

heatcraft

rpd.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 Le-Jo

Discount No Bid 31% 30.5% No Bid No Bid 30% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

79 Lincoln 

Discount No Bid 31% 41.7% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

lincolnfp.

com

www.

lincolnfp.

com
80 Lincoln Impinger

Discount No Bid 31% 41.7% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81 Litton

Discount No Bid No Bid 32.5% No Bid 38.5% 25% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

82 Manitowoc

Discount No Bid 20% 30.5% No Bid 35.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

83 Mannhart

Discount No Bid 0% 10.5% No Bid 10.75% 20% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 Market Forge

Discount No Bid 31% 41.4% No Bid 41.5% 41%,

20%-boilers

All vendors that

submitted
Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.mfii.com No Bid

85 Masters Disposers

Discount No Bid 20% 25.5% No Bid 26.5% 30% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

86 Maytag

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87 Metro

Discount No Bid 31% 40.5% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

metro.com
88 Mod U Serve

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% 41% All vendors that

submitted
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Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

89 Montague

Discount No Bid 31% 37.5% No Bid 41% 45% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

montague

company.com

90 New Age

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

91 Panasonic

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

92 Paragon

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

icca.

inven

sys.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

93 Penn/Johnson

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

johnson

controls.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

94 Pitco

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 10.5-30.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

pitco.com

No Bid

95 Prince Castle

Discount No Bid 31% 40.5% No Bid 41.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

princecastle.

com

www.

princecastle.

com

96 Ranco

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

icca.

invensys.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

97 Randell

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 30.75% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

unified

brands.net

No Bid

98 Rational

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 30.75% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

rational

usa.com

No Bid

99 Redco

Discount No Bid No Bid 40.5% No Bid 38.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 Remcor

Discount No Bid 31% 30.5% No Bid 41.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted
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Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

imiremcor.

com

No Bid

101 Reynolds

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

102 Robot Coupe

Discount No Bid 0-20% 30.5% No Bid 23.5-28.5%

23.5%-

accessories

30%

20%

accessories

All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

robot

coupeusa.

com

No Bid

103 Royal

Discount No Bid 31% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

104 Rubbermaid

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

105 Russell

Discount 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website www.

tyler

refrigerati

on.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

106 Sage

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

107 Salvajor

Discount No Bid 31% 35.5% No Bid 38.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

salvajor.com

www.

salvajor.com

108 Sani Serve

Discount No Bid No Bid 25.5% 23% No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

saniserv.com

No Bid No Bid

109 Scotsman

Discount No Bid 20% 40.5% 23.00% 37.75% 35% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid www.

scotsman-

ice.com

www.

scotsman-

ice.com

www.

scotsman-

ice.com
110 Seco

Discount No Bid 31% 40.5% No Bid 38.5% 30% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

delfield.com

No Bid

111 Sharp

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112 Shelley

Discount No Bid No Bid 41.4% No Bid 38.5% 41%,

20%-access.

All vendors that

submitted
Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

113 Shur Flo
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

114 Silver King

Discount No Bid 20% 30.5% No Bid 40.5% 20% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

silverking.

com

No Bid

115 Sink Mater

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

116 Southbend

Discount No Bid 31% 41.4% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

southbendnc.

com

www.

southbendnc.

com

117 Sporlan

Discount varies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website www.

sporlan.co

m

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

118 Spray Master

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

119 Star

Discount No Bid 31% 41.2% No Bid 36.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

star-mfg

online.com

No Bid

120 Stellar Steam

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

121 Stero

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 35.5% 41%

25% drop ship

All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.stero.co

m

No Bid

122 Sub Zero

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

123 Sunkist

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% 35% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

124 T&S Brass & Bronze Works

Discount No Bid 31% 42.3% No Bid 41% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

tsbrass.com

No Bid

125 Taylor Freezer

Discount No Bid 31% 0.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

126 Tecumseh

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Websitesee Copeland No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

127 Thermodyne

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid All vendors that

submitted
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

128 Thermakool

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

129 Toastmaster

Discount No Bid 31% 21.4% No Bid 20.5% $1-$250=41%

$250.01-

$400=35%

$400.01+=25%

All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

star-mfg

online.com

No Bid

130 Tomlinson 

Discount No Bid No Bid 30.5% No Bid 35.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

tomlinsoninc.

com

No Bid

131 Traulsen & Co.

Discount No Bid 31% 41.4% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

traulsen.com

No Bid

132 TRUE

Discount No Bid 31% 37.6% 23% 40.5% 45% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid www.

truemfg.com

www.

truemfg.com

No Bid

133 Ventmaster

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.5% No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

134 Vollrath

Discount No Bid 31% 36.4% No Bid 36.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

vollrathco.

com

No Bid

135 Vulcan
Discount No Bid 0% 21.4% No Bid 22.5% 25% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid www.

vulcan

hart.com

No Bid

136 Waring
Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 36.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

waring

products.

com

No Bid

137 Wasco
Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 Waste King

Discount No Bid 31% 30.5% No Bid 30.75% 25% All vendors that

submitted
Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.waste

king.com

No Bid

139 Welbilt

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.5% 41%,

25%-access.

All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

140 Wells

11



Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

Discount No Bid 31% 41.3% No Bid 40.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

141 Whirlpool

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

142 White Rodgers

Discount varies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website www.

emerson

climate

contractor

.

com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

143 White-Westinghouse

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

144 Winland

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

145 Winston Industries

Discount No Bid 31% 36.4% No Bid 37.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

winston

ind.com

No Bid

146 Witco

Discount No Bid 31% 30.5% No Bid 35.5% 41% All vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

witco.com

No Bid

147 Wolf Range

Discount No Bid 20% 20.5% No Bid 22.5% 25%,

20%-access.

all vendors that

submitted

Manufacturer's Website No Bid www.

gcsparts.com

No Bid No Bid www.

wolfrange.

com

www.

wolfrange.

com
148 X-Stream Wash

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

149 3M

Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer's Website No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

State discount off 

manufacturer catalog/pirce 

list of other kitchen 

equipment repair parts sold 

by your company. If more 

are offered, please add at 

the bottom of this page.

Manufacturer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See attached

Catalog Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See attached

Website Address No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See attached

Section II.

Aquapure-50%, 

www.cuno.com

Cuno-50%, 

www.cuno.com
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Kitchen Repair Parts and Services

Bid # 3757

Barsco Ecolab

dba GCS 

Service, Inc.

Heritage

Food

Service

Equipmt.

ISI

Commercial

Refrigeration, 

L.P.

Northern

Parts &

Service

Whaley

Foodservice

Parts

RecommendationsVendors:

1 State hourly charge per 

person for repairs of kitchen 

equipment at various 

locations on an as-needed 

basis during school hours.

No Bid $83.00 No Bid $90.00 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

2 State hourly charge per 

person for repairs of kitchen 

equipment at various 

locations on an as-needed 

basis after school hours.

No Bid $124.50 No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

3 State service charge for a 

regular service call within 

Plano ISD - 7:00am and 

4:00 pm timeframe, Monday-

Friday

No Bid $82.00 No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

4 State service charge for an 

emergency call within Plano 

ISD before 7:00 am and 

after 4:00 pm, Monday-

Friday.

No Bid $123.00 No Bid $102.50 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

5 State service charge for an 

emergency call within Plano 

ISD on the weekends.

No Bid $123.00 No Bid $102.50 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

6 State percentage mark up on 

manufacturer's published 

price list for repair parts:

No Bid no mark up;

0-30%

discount off of

MSRP on all

mfrs.

No Bid 0% No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

7 State service charge, per 

hour, for installation of new 

equipment listed below:

Steamers No Bid $78.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Ice Machines No Bid $78.85 No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Booster Heaters No Bid $78.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted

Other Types of Installations No Bid $78.85 No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid All vendors that

submitted
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