
Calculators

Bid # 2007-067

Bid Request Number 2007-067

Title Calculators

Close Date 11/1/2007

Line 1 TI-84 Plus Graphing 

Calculator (pack of ten)

Name Price Note to Buyer Recommendation

Lakeshore Equipment Company $257.75 Lakeshore item# NZ178 Math Explorer Plus 

Calculator Kit

Please reference quote #4980 on your purchase 

order.

RH Enterprises $950.98 RH Enterprises

D&H Distributing Company $951.50 The TI-84 Plus is available individually 

(TI84PLUS) or in a teacher pack of 10 in EZ-

Spot Yellow (TI84PLUSTKYEL)

Scantex Business Systems $954.90 Order No. TI-84Plus EZ-Spot/TP

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $973.17 EAI item #70852

OM Office Supply Inc. $999.00* *Price has been altered to show price for a pack 

of ten TI 84 plus - 

$ 999.00

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $1,009.40 SchoolPacks Yellow Bus EZ Spot, Marked 

"School Property" Part #TI-84 Plus Sch Pack

Thermo Fisher Scientific $1,118.64 FSE Catalog# S68601EZ

Price of $1118.64 is for pack of 10 (36 packs 

total)

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. No Bid

Line 2 TI-108 Teacher Kit

Name Price Note to Buyer

D&H Distributing Company $36.60 D&H Distributing

RH Enterprises $37.13

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $37.32 EAI item #70003-001

OM Office Supply Inc. $37.50 TI 108TK contains 10 TI 108 calculators.

Value for a pack of ten TI 108 Teacher Kit is 

$375.00

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $39.69

Scantex Business Systems $40.90 Order No. TI-108/TK

Thermo Fisher Scientific $42.37 FSE Catalog# S43195TP

Price of $42.37 is for pack of 10 (108 packs 

total)

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. $69.50* Teacher's kit contains 10 calculators /reusable 

storage caddy / Teacher's Guide in English & 

Spanish and Calculator poster price at $69.50 

item

# TI 1004-A8

Lakeshore Equipment Company $75.53 Lakeshore item #NZ108 T.I. 108 Student 

Calculator Kit

please reference quote 4980 on purchase order.

Line 3 TI-203TK Overhead 

Calculator (Stokes)

Name Price Note to Buyer

OM Office Supply Inc. $27.27

RH Enterprises $28.42 RH Enterprises

D&H Distributing Company $28.56

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $28.90

Scantex Business Systems $29.49 Order No. Stokes 203

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $29.50 EAI item #78001
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Lakeshore Equipment Company No Bid

Thermo Fisher Scientific No Bid

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. No Bid

Line 4 TI-15 Teacher Kit

Name Price Note to Buyer

RH Enterprises $121.40 RH Enterprises

D&H Distributing Company $121.50

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $123.25 EAI item #70251

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $123.89

Scantex Business Systems $123.90 Order No. TI-15/TK

OM Office Supply Inc. $125.00 Value for a pack of 1- TI 15 teacher Kit 

$1,250.00

Thermo Fisher Scientific $141.24 FSE Catalog# S90262TP

Price of 141.24 is for pack of 10 (108 packs 

total)

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. $185.00* *Price has been altered to show Teacher kit item 

# TI 1012-A8 $185.00 per kit

Lakeshore Equipment Company $223.25 Lakeshore item #NZ43 T.I.15 Calculator Kit 

please reference quote 4980 on your purchase 

orders.

Line 5 TI-251TK Overhead 

Calculator (Stokes)

Name Price Note to Buyer

OM Office Supply Inc. $54.54

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $56.50 EAI item #78010 EAI Education

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $56.76

RH Enterprises $57.00

D&H Distributing Company $57.11

Scantex Business Systems $57.60 Order No. Stokes 251

Lakeshore Equipment Company No Bid

Thermo Fisher Scientific No Bid

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. No Bid

Line 6 TI-30X IIS Solar 

Scientific Calculator
Name Price Note to Buyer

D&H Distributing Company $101.08 D&H Distributing

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $102.44 EAI item #70333

RH Enterprises $103.01

Scantex Business Systems $103.90 Order No. TI-30X IIS/TK

OM Office Supply Inc. $104.00 Value for a pack of Ten TI 30X IIS - $ 1,040.00

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $104.90

Thermo Fisher Scientific $117.51 FSE Catalog# S65241TP

Price of $117.51 is for pack of 10 (150 packs 

total)

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. No Bid

Lakeshore Equipment Company No Bid

Line 7 TI-36X Solar Scientific 

Calculator
Name Price Note to Buyer

D&H Distributing Company $15.15 The TI-36X calculator is only available 

individually. 
D&H Distributing

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $15.30 EAI item #79052

RH Enterprises $15.40 This model is not available in a pack of ten, it is 

only sold individually.  Price quote is for one 

calculator.

2



Calculators

Bid # 2007-067

OM Office Supply Inc. $15.50 Value for a pack of ten TI 36X- $ 155.00

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $15.99

Thermo Fisher Scientific $17.51 FSE Catalog# S40642

Price of $17.51 is per unit (item is not available 

as pack of 10)

Scantex Business Systems $159.40 Order No. TI-36X Solar/10pk

Lakeshore Equipment Company No Bid

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. No Bid

Line 8 Casio FX-260 Solar 

Scientific Calculator

Name Price Note to Buyer

EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. $6.98 EAI item #11383E (single) EAI Education

OM Office Supply Inc. $7.65 Value for a pack of ten Casio FX 260 - $ 76.50

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. $7.99

D&H Distributing Company $8.06 The FX-260 calculator is only available 

individually. 

RH Enterprises $8.29* Price has been altered to show "each" price

Scantex Business Systems $8.99* *Price has been altered to show "each"price; 

Order No. Casio FX-260 Solar/10pk

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. $15.99* *Price has been altered to show individual price 

@ $15.99/each; class set of 30 @ $455.00 per 

set

Lakeshore Equipment Company No Bid

Thermo Fisher Scientific No Bid

Line 9

Name Percent Off Note to Buyer

RH Enterprises 0.00% yes

Saddleback Educational Publishing, Inc. 0.00% 0% discount as our catalogs already reflect discount 

pricing. Please note our prices are subject to change 

throughout the year.

yes

D&H Distributing Company 0.00% Please note that D&H's catalog pricing already 

reflects educational discounts.  D&H also holds a 

graphing calculator contract with the Department of 

Information Resources (DIR) for the State of Texas. 

Please note that D&H's catalog pricing already 

reflects educational discounts.  D&H also holds a 

graphing calculator contract with the Department of 

Information Resources (DIR) for the State of Texas. 

yes

Scantex Business Systems 1.00% yes

Wholesale Electronic Supply, Inc. 2.00% yes

Lakeshore Equipment Company 5.00% Discount not valid on already discounted items.

On orders over $500 shipping to one location:Free 

Shipping

Orders under $500 estimate freight charges at 10% 

of subtotal (min. charge of $5)

yes

OM Office Supply Inc. 5.00% no

During the term of this bid we may have additional needs, not line 

listed above.  If you agree to extend coverage under this bid to all 

other items in your catalog or on your website, please state 

percentage of discount you will offer us off your listed price.  If you 

do not offer a discount, please enter "0%". If you make no entry, you 

will be considered non-responsive to item #9.
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EAI Education, a division of Eric Armin, Inc. 15.00% EXCEPTIONS TO DISCOUNT:Discount NOT 

included on calculators & peripherals, CBLs, CBRs, 

probes, Navigator Systems, Stopwatches, or 

overhead projectors.

No minimum order. Shipping on orders over $100 is 

free, under $100 add $7 for shipping.  Oversized 

items, drop shipped from factory. Actual shipping 

charges apply.

yes

Thermo Fisher Scientific 24.00% Catalog discount pricing is valid until July 31, 2009. 

$150 minimum order for free shipping.
yes
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