Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Bid Request Number
Title

Close Date

Line 1

Name

Team Sports of Texas
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Alert Services, Inc.

Riddell

Plano Sports Center
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Line 2

Name

R B Sporting Goods
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Team Sports of Texas
Plano Sports Center

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Complete Athlete, Inc.

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Line 3

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company

2007-078
Football Equipment & Supplies Bid
1/10/2008

Belts, football, natural, web with two metal D rings

Price per dozen
$7.80
$9.12
$10.80
$11.76
$11.88
$14.25
$15.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Chin Strap, 4 point high hook-up, hardcup, black or white

Price per dozen
$64.00
$71.52
$75.00
$77.89
$79.20
$87.00
$92.04
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Dummy core, solid poly foam core, 16 Ib. x 18" x 56"

Price
$82.00
$119.75
$130.00/alt.
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Recommendation

Team Sports of Texas

RB Sporting Goods

Barcelona




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Line 4

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company

Line 5

Name

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company

Line 6

Name

Team Sports of Texas
Barcelona Sporting Goods
R B Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center
Frisco Sports Center, LLC
Sportime

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 7

Name
Team Sports of Texas

Dummy, hand held shield, solid foam, 20"x30"x4"

Price
$32.24
$36.88
$74.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Dummy, forearm pad, 4" thick, contoured to arm

Price
$26.88
$38.60

$58.00/pair
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, WILSON GST 1005-P

Price
$34.00
$38.00
$39.00
$47.88
$50.00
$52.24
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, WILSON GST F1003 NCAA

Price
$52.25

Barcelona

Plano Sports Center

Team Sports of Texas

Team Sports of Texas




Football Supplies and Equipment

Bid # 2007-078

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
R B Sporting Goods
Sportime

Frisco Sports Center, LLC

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 8

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 9

Name

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Plano Sports Center
Gopher Sport

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Line 10

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Team Sports of Texas

$53.88
$56.00
$58.00
$59.49/alt.
$75.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, NIKE #3005

Price Exceptions

$38.60 Schools will not be using Nike footballs

$43.00
$43.40
$43.88
$48.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, NIKE #2000

Price Exceptions

$26.00 Schools will not be using Nike footballs

$26.00
$27.00
$28.00
$29.70
$33.34
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, RAWLINGS

Price
$32.00
$33.00
$43.00

ST5

No award

No award

Barcelona




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 11

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods

Plano Sports Center

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 12

Name

Riddell

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Alert Services, Inc.

R B Sporting Goods
Team Sports of Texas
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Bill Fritz Sports Corporation

Line 13

Name
Plano Sports Center

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Riddell

$46.66
$48.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Football, leather, Youth, RAWLINGS Pro 5

Price
$23.00
$29.00
$33.00
$39.97
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Girdles, sizes Small - 4X, black or white, STROMGEN, #1551

Price per dozen
$143.88/alt.
$182.98
$195.48
$213.60
$224.76
$273.00
$277.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Available in white only; black also required

Meets the Distric's needs.

Gloves, Linebacker, grey, ADIDAS Mens Blitz Il

Price per pair
$21.12
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Barcelona

Plano Sports Center

Plano Sports Center




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 14

Name

Alert Services, Inc.
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center
Complete Athlete, Inc.

R B Sporting Goods
Team Sports of Texas
Frisco Sports Center, LLC

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 15

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods

Team Sports of Texas
Frisco Sports Center, LLC
Alert Services, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 16

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.
Team Sports of Texas
Frisco Sports Center, LLC

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gloves, grey, CUTTER LINEMAN Z-017LC

Price per pair
$35.46
$36.00
$39.60
$39.67
$39.95
$40.38
$44.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gloves, grey, CUTTER LINEMAN Z017-LT

Price per pair
$36.00
$40.67
$40.92
$42.60
$42.85
$46.50
$48.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Gloves, grey, CUTTER RECEIVER 017X

Price per pair
$27.00
$29.70
$29.95
$31.34
$33.75
$34.00
No Bid
No Bid

Alert Services

Barcelona

Barcelona




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation

Line 17

Name

Team Sports of Texas
Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Barcelona Sporting Goods

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 18

Name
Riddell

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Team Sports of Texas

Plano Sports Center

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 19

Name

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Helmet, white, with OPO or JOP facemask attached, NOKONA NPJH-8

Price
$41.00
$43.69
$49.99
$66.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Helmet, sizes Small - XL, white with S-ROPO or S-RJOP black or grey
facemask attached, SCHUTT, Air Advantage

Price
$116.99/alt.

$129.00
$137.50
$137.88
$149.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Vendors were not given an option to bid on alternates.
Schutt helmets exclusively are used in grades 9 and 10
- we already have Schutt parts for repair so purchasing
Riddell helmets would require us to buy Riddell parts
as well.

Meets the District's Specification.

Helmet Universal Jaw Pads, firm, 1/2" - 1 1/4", white, pairs

Price per dozen

$26.00
$28.00
$28.80
$32.88
$39.60
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions
Nokona jaw pads are not universal
Meets the District's Specification.

Team Sports of Texas

Barcelona

RB Sporting Goods




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Gopher Sport
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 20

Name
Riddell

Team Sports of Texas
Alert Services, Inc.

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 21

Name
Riddell

Team Sports of Texas
Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 22

Name

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Alert Services, Inc.
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Hip Pad Set, HPAR, regular, white vinyl dipped, NOKONA

Price per set
$5.75/alt.

$8.00
$9.76
$10.45
$12.79
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Riddell pad sets are not as thick and durable as
Nokona

Meets the District's needs. Team Sports of Texas

Hip Pad Set, high rise, white vinyl dipped, NOKONA

Price per set
$7.99/alt.

$10.00
$11.35
$11.68
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Riddell pad sets are not as thick and durable as
Nokona

Meets the District's needs. Team Sports of Texas

Hip Pad Set, SCHUTT V3PP, #130611X

Price per set
$6.50
$7.97
$7.98
$8.76
$9.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Team Sports of Texas




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc
Henry Schein Inc

Line 23

Name
Riddell

R B Sporting Goods

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Alert Services, Inc.

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 24

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Alert Services, Inc.

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Team Sports of Texas

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Frisco Sports Center, LLC

R B Sporting Goods
Complete Athlete, Inc.

Plano Sports Center

Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 25

Name

Plano Sports Center
Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods
Frisco Sports Center, LLC
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Z Wear, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Knee Pads, regular or large, white vinyl dipped, NOKONA KP-6

Price per pair
$3.89/alt.

$3.99
$3.99
$4.11
$4.17
$7.55
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Riddell pad is 8" only; Regular and Large sizes are
also needed.
Tie is awarded to Plano vendor.

Local Vendor

Mouthguards, football, boil-n-bite, black or maroon, package of 100

Price per pkg.
$21.00
$22.00
$23/alt.
$25.00
$25.00
$25.00
$27.00
$30.00
$35.00
$50.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Pants, football, white, RUSSELL #F14CAMX

Price per dozen
$130.56
$135.00/$148.80
$142.32
$180.00/$210.00
$198.00
$444.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Plano Sports Center

Barcelona

Plano Sports Center




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Line 26

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
R B Sporting Goods

Plano Sports Center

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Team Sports of Texas
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Line 27

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Plano Sports Center

Riddell

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 28

Name

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Frisco Sports Center, LLC
Team Sports of Texas
Riddell

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Rule Book, Football, 2008, NCAA

Price
$9.95
$15.00
$24.98
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Scrimmage vest, football, heavy duty, porthole mesh, 100% nylon, elastic

waist, various colors, package of 12

Price per dozen
$31.00
$44.16
$48.48
$59.88
$66.00
$84.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

T-Shirt, Dri fit, with one color logo

Price per dozen
$75.00
$79.20
$180.00
$135.00

$154.56/S-XL

$166.56/XXL
$156.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Barcelona

Barcelona

Plano Sports Center




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Gopher Sport

Line 29

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 30

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Team Sports of Texas

R B Sporting Goods

Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 31
Name

Alert Services

R B Sporting Goods

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Riddell

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Plano Sports Center

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 32

Name

No Bid

Shoulder Pad, sizes Small - X-Large, RAWLINGS CP-36+

Price
$34.00
$40.89
$44.00
$48.00

$99.00/alt.
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Shoulder Pad, sizes Medium - X-large, RAWLINGS CP-46+

Price
$40.00
$47.88
$52.75
$55.00

$200.99/alt.
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Shoulder Pad Elastic, 1 1/2", 25 yd. roll

Price

$15.92/white  $16.79

black
$17.95
$18.00
$23.72
$24.50
$27.00
$28.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Shoulder Pad Laces, white, gross of 50

Price per gross

Barcelona

Barcelona

Alert Services




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Riddell

Team Sports of Texas
Plano Sports Center

RB Sporting Goods
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Line 33

Name
Riddell

Alert Services, Inc.

Plano Sports Center
Barcelona Sporting Goods

R B Sporting Goods

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

Line 34

Name

Plano Sports Center
Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific
Barcelona Sporting Goods
Riddell

Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

Line 35

Name
Riddell
Plano Sports Center

Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Alert Services, Inc.

$12.99
$18.72
$18.78
$20.16
$24.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Thigh Pads, white vinyl dipped, NOKONA #UTG-R or L

Price per pair
$6.18/alt.

$6.91

$7.15
$7.39
$7.95
$12.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Exceptions

Bid Regular size only; Regular and Large also

required.

Bid Regular size only; Regular and Large also

required.
Meets District's specification.

Helmet Reconditioning, Schutt Air Advantage

Price
$30.37
$38.25
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Helmet Reconditioning - Riddell Revolution

Price
$21.00
$33.37
No Bid
No Bid

Riddell

Plano Sports Center

Plano Sports Center

Riddell




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Team Sports of Texas

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Medco Supply Company
Rogers Athletic Company
Gopher Sport

R B Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
Neff Motivation Inc

Henry Schein Inc

Line 36

Name

Barcelona Sporting Goods
Bill Fritz Sports Corporation
CoachComm LLC

R B Sporting Goods

Riddell
Sportdecals
Rogers Athletic Company

Aluminum Athletic Equipment

Co.
Neff Motivation Inc

BSN Sports/Collegiate Pacific

Gopher Sport

Z Wear, Inc.

Medco Supply Company

Alert Services, Inc.

Sportime

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Percent Discount off Catalog/Pricelist

Percent Off

No Bid
No Bid
0.00%

0.00%

1%-23%
1.00%
2.00%

5.00%

5.00%

10.00%

10.00%

0.00%
10.00%

15.00%

15.00%

Note to Buyer

Please call for pricing on any items in our
CoachComm Playbook Catalog.

All prices are already discounted as we are a "team
dealer” and do not have a retail business

1-23% discount from catalog price.
Free UPS truck shipping

Rogers Athletic Company is offering a 2%
Discount off of our catalog prices and website
prices.

FOOTBALL SECTION ONLY

See website www.neffco.com for apparel catalog.
Catalogs can be ordered on line at no charges.

10% OFF CURRENT BSN SPORTS / COLLEGIATE
PACIFIC CATALOG WITH EXCEPTIONS. PLEASE
SEE ATTACHED EXCEPTIONS LIST.

This discount applies to everything in the current
Gopher catalog EXCEPT - "Only from Gopher";
Climbing Walls; and Polar Fitness products. Free
Shipping does not apply to TRUCK items - (see
catalog icon). These items will be discounted and
current freight will be applied. All supplies ship
free. FOB Plano

Z Wear, Inc. Champro Sports - 35

10% discount current list/catalog price. May not
apply to some items.

15% OFF CATALOG PRICES.

10% OFF JOHNSON & JOHNSON PRODUCTS
ONLY. ITEMS PRICED OVER $150.00 CALL FOR
SPECIAL DISCOUNT PRICING.PRICES DO NOT
INCLUDE INSTALLATION. CUSTOM ORDERS ARE
NON-RETURNABLE. ORDERS IF RETURNED ARE
SUBJECT TO THE MANUFACTURERS
RESTOCKING FEE AND RETURN FREIGHT
CHARGES. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY
DISCREPANCIES NOT REPORTED IMMEDIATELY.
ANY DAMAGES OR SHORTAGES MUST BE
MARKED AS SUCH ON SHIPPING DOCUMENTS

15% w/ a 1 or 3 prefix and a 204 prefix. Review
cover letter on our terms and conditions.




Football Supplies and Equipment
Bid # 2007-078

Henry Schein Inc

Complete Athlete, Inc.

Frisco Sports Center

Plano Sports Center

Team Sports of Texas

18.00%

20.00%

25.00%

25.00%

30.00%

See Below for Deviations:

Books, Athletic Tape 12%

Furniture, Medical Equipment, Ice Machine,
Exercise Equipment, vision testers 15% plus Frt.
Dental Equipment 10%

RX Items Call

Office Supplies N/A

Manufacturer for all heavy furniture and equipment
Hazardous materials charges will be added.
Orders subject to fuel charge. No minimum
amount for discount but there is a $9.00 fee on
orders under $100.00.

WE DO NOT HAVE A COMPANY CATALOG. WE
DO OFFER TEAM DISCOUNTS FROM 10-35% OFF
OUR VENDORS CATALOGS. PLEASE CALL FOR
A QUOTE WHICH DEPENDS ON ITEM, QUANTITY.
Standard discount of 25% off vendor's suggested
retail pricing.

The discount includes catalog list pricing for these
catalogs:
Adidas/Nike/Schutt/Russell/Rawlings/Adams/
Alleson/Underarmour/Tachikara/Wilson/Easton/
Louisville Slugger/DeLong/Holloway/SanMar




